
214

Organizacija, Volume 55 Issue 3, August 2022Research Papers

1 
Received: 16th March 2022; revised: 9th June 2022; accepted: 15th June 2022

Psychological Capital and 
Organizational Performance: The 
Mediating Role of Organizational 

Ambidexterity

Sohrab GHANIZADEH1, Farzad Sattari ARDABILI1*, Mohammad KHEI-
RANDISH1, Eshagh RASOULI1, Mohammad HASSANZADEH2

1 Department of Management, Ardabil Branch, Islamic Azad University, Ardabil, Iran  
(*corresponding author: F.sattari@iauardabil.ac.ir)

2 Department of Economics, University of Mohaghegh, Ardabili, Iran

Background and purpose: Today’s dynamic environment is increasingly pressuring public organizations to be 
simultaneously flexible and efficient. The purpose of this study was to examine the mediating role of organizational 
ambidexterity in the relationship between psychological capital and the perfor-mance of public organizations that 
have bureaucratic limitations to their activity and are not as competitive as the private sector. 
Methods: A questionnaire was developed and distributed among the employees of Management and Planning Orga-
nizations in 31 provinces in Iran, and a total of 373 questionnaires were returned. The data was analysed using CFA 
to validate the measures, and then the mediating effects of organi-zational ambidexterity was tested. 
Results: The results indicated the significant relationship between psychological capital and organizational perfor-
mance (B=0.55) and the positive mediation effect of organizational ambidexterity on this relationship (0.333). 
Conclusion:  The findings can help managers of public organizations to enhance their organizational perfor-mance 
by strengthening psychological capital and ambidexterity.

Keywords: Organizational ambidexterity; Psychological capital; Organizational performance; Public Organizations

DOI: 10.2478/orga-2022-0014

1	 Introduction

The rapidly changing and increasingly competitive 
business environment has driven organizations to focus on 
efficient activities in the short and long term and gaining 
competitive advantages (Cao et al., 2009). In addition to 
the for-profit sector, these changes have also challenged 
government agencies to improve their ability to adapt to 
the environment. However, government agencies have 
high degrees of centralization and bureaucracy and are 
subject to various laws that put them under immense pres-
sure to create stability and maintain balance. Meanwhile, 
due to environmental pressures in the service sector, the 

only way for these organizations to adapt is to develop 
their ability to simultaneously exploit existing assets and 
capabilities while exploring new, fundamental capabilities 
(Markides, 2013). This means that ambidexreity may be 
helpful to better adapt with the environment. Ambidexter-
ity is the combination of both efficiency-oriented and nov-
eltyoriented innovation practices (e.g., exploitation and 
exploration) for short-term success and long-term survival 
(Clauss, 2021).

While various studies have highlighted the important 
role of organizational ambidexterity in the growth and sur-
vival of organizations and its positive effect on organiza-
tional performance (Kauppila & Tempelaar, 2016; Junni et 
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al., 2013; Gibson & Birkinshaw, 2004), these studies have 
mainly focused on the private sector (Smith & Umans, 
2015). There are very few studies on ambidexterity and 
performance in the public sector (Cannaerts et al., 2020; 
Ghanizadeh et al., 2020) with mixed results (Junni et al., 
2013). Some studies have found a positive relation-ship 
(Gibson & Birkinshaw, 2004; Lubatkin et al., 2006), some 
a negative relationship (Atuahene-Gima, 2005) and some 
a contingent effect (Lin et al., 2007). 

Public organizations face pressures for greater in-
novation and meeting pre-determined tar-gets (Plimmer 
et al., 2017). However, engaging in both innovation and 
optimization activities simultaneously can create tensions 
between them (Gieske et al., 2020), which requires pub-
lic organizations to be ambidextrous.  However, there is 
evidence suggesting that a U-shaped relationship exists 
between ambidexterity and performance (Yang & Atua-
hene-Gima, 2007), while a number of studies have found 
no relationship (Venkatraman et al., 2007). The dearth of 
evidence has led some to view ambidexterity as a public 
sector problem (Lee et al., 2012) and even question wheth-
er public organizations in general can be ambidextrous. 
While the term organizational ambidexterity itself may 
not have been used in the context of the public sector, its 
com-ponents have been considered in the literature (Smith 
& Omans, 2015). According to Bryson et al. (2008), pub-
lic organizations can have the capacity and opportunity to 
adopt ambidextrous structures and cultures (Bryson et al, 
2008), since environmental pressure for delivery of new 
services in the public sector force these organizations to 
innovate similar to the private sector. But in public or-
ganizations such as Iran’s Ministry of Management and 
Planning, which is a highly centralized and beurucratic or-
ganization, ambidexterity is defined not by organizatrional 
performance, but also by the management’s ambidexteri-
ous behavior. Organizations affiliated with the Ministry of 
Management and Planningin all the provinces of Iran have 
the same structure, but with different managers who must 
carefully adapt to environmental changes. Therefore, their 
ambidexterity could be considered for prediction of organ-
izational level ambidexterity. 

Individuals and managers are a key element in explo-
ration and innovation in the public sector. Studies have 
shown that individuals play a fundamental role (Raisch 
et al., 2009) and that the characteristics, capabilities, and 
behaviors of the members of the organization should be 
considered to better understand organizational ambidex-
terity (Kauppila & Tempelaar, 2016). Managers of or-
ganizations in particular provide an important context for 
exploration and exploitation through their decisions and 
actions (Gibson & Birkinshaw, 2004). They play a more 
sig-nificant role than environmental forces in determining 
organizational outcomes, and their bounded rationality is 
reflected in their decisions and consequently organization-
al outcomes (Smith & Umans, 2015). Similar to the private 

sector, the managers and employees of public organiza-
tions work in a competitive environment and have to keep 
pace with changes in the environment. Psychological traits 
of these individuals are an important driver of innovation. 
For this reason, organizations are increasingly focusing on 
the psychological needs and psychological capital of their 
employees (Qiu et al, 2015). Psychological capital goes 
beyond human and social capital and is positive associat-
ed with work motivation and performance (Larson & Lu-
thans, 2006) and could be a key factor in individual and 
organizational ambidexterity and improve performance 
through efficiency and innovation. Therefore,  this study 
aims to consider the psychological capacities of individu-
als and managers as a useful approach to enabling public 
organizations to become ambidextrous through individual 
ambidexterity. In other words, the ambidexterity of public 
organizations should be expressed by the explorative and 
exploitative behaviors of the managers.

2	 Theoretical Framework and 
Hypotheses 

2.1	Organizational ambidexterity and 
psychological capital

Organizational ambidexterity challenges managers in 
organizations (Jansen et al., 2008). Managers play a cru-
cial role in achieving organizational goals by allowing 
the organization to redeploy resources efficiently and ef-
fectively while pursuing new opportunities or respond to 
threats quicker than competitors (Hodgkinson et al, 2011). 
Together with the environment, they create an important 
context for ambidextrous behavior (Lavie et al, 2010) and 
should be able to flexibly shift between exploration and 
exploitation (Good & Michel, 2013), reconcile conflicting 
demands, balance seemingly contradictory forces in the 
organization (Jansen et al., 2008), and serve as the main 
driving force behind ambidexterity (Jansen et al., 2009). 
This role of managers and employees in public organiza-
tions is far more complex than in the private sector. Public 
sector actors are not only limited in terms of authority and 
decision-making, but also have different organizational 
missions that are not primarily related to competition with 
other organizations. Moreover, the managers of public or-
ganizations are accountable to various politi-cal and com-
munity stakeholders and thus operate under a great deal of 
pressure, which makes their ability to foster ambidextrous 
behavior much more important. This could be challeng-
ing as public organizations are under pressure to innovate 
(Nowacki & Monk, 2020) and public sector employees 
tend to resist innovation (Gieske et al., 2020). A review of 
the literature on innovation in the public sector shows that 
most studies have focused on the antecedents of innova-
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tion and less attention has been paid to its actual outcomes 
(Gieske et al., 2019). 

Adopted from Gibson and Birkinshaw (2004), Fiset 
and Dostaler (2017) suggest four ambidextrous behaviors 
(initiator, cooperator, broker, and multitasker) and explain 
how to create an organizational structure for ambidexterity 
to align and adapt at the individual level. Individual differ-
ences underpin the ambidextrous behavior of the members 
of the organization (Kauppila & Tempelaar, 2016, 2016; 
Raisch et al., 2009) and understanding them is essential 
to under-standing ambidextrous behavior at the individual 
level (Raisch et al., 2009). However, achieving individual 
ambidexterity is very difficult, since innovation and op-
timization require completely different structures and ca-
pabilities that can create conflicting challenges for each 
individual (Eisenhardt et al., 2010). These challenges af-
fect emotions and, consequently, individual performance 
is affected because factors such as positive reinforcement, 
positive affect, and attitudes of employees (including man-
agers) affect their performance (Luthans, 2002), and indi-
vidual performance is a function of individual ability and 
motivation (Wright et al., 1995). However, despite docu-
mented role of emotions, there is still little known about 
what accounts for individual ability to manage conflicting 
demands (Eisenhardt et al., 2010) and the psychological 
characteristics that can be used as predictors of these be-
haviors have not received much attention (Kauppila & 
Tempelaar, 2016). 

Luthans has developed the theory of psychological 
capital to explain how the psychological capacities of in-
dividuals can be measured, developed, and managed to 
enhance both individual and organizational effectiveness 
(Newman et al., 2013). Research suggests that high psy-
chological capital can trigger innovative behaviors in the 
workplace (Avey et al., 2010) and look for alternative path-
ways to achieve goals when faced with obstacles. They ac-
tively work on creative ideas to solve problems and look 
at problems and opportunities from different angles (Zhou 
& George, 2003), and have the willpower to overcome 
the risks and challenges of failure. These individuals feel 
in control of their destiny, show resilience in the face of 
problems and adversity, expect positive incomes, develop 
innovative ideas (Sweetman et al., 2011), and pursue new 
and creative approaches to problem solving (Peterson & 
Byron, 2008). 

Ambidexterity in public organizations such as gov-
ernment agencies is mostly influenced by the managers 
who play a key role in the decision-making process and 
in balancing the environmental pressure to explore and the 
internal pressure to exploit. They need to be more self-ef-
ficacious to have more work control and make better deci-
sions (Narangerel & Semerci, 2020), a characteristic that is 
associated with their psychological capital. By being open 
to organizational change, individuals with high psycholog-
ical capital are able to develop new paths to achieve goals, 

have a positive outlook on the future, and adapt to changes 
and problems (Youssef & Luthans, 2007). Psychological 
capital allows individuals to move beyond the challenges 
and setbacks that are inherent to creative work (Sweetman 
et al., 2011). In addition, psychological capital helps ex-
plain the behavioral differences between individuals and 
managers which could be useful for predicting resistance 
to or support of innovation (Ghanizadeh et al., 2020). Due 
to their positive affective and cognitive appraisals, indi-
viduals with high psychological capital persevere in the 
face of problems, find and implement more constructive 
and useful solutions to problems, and view the outcomes 
of their effort in a more positive light. Therefore we can 
expect the following:

H1: Psychological capital has a positive effect on or-
ganizational ambidexterity.

2.2	Ambidexterity and organizational 
performance

The performance of public organizations is a multi-
dimensional construct (Andrews et al., 2010), which is 
evaluated based on criteria such as efficiency, effective-
ness, quality, responsiveness, and legitimacy toward stake-
holders (Yang & Panday, 2007). Public organizations are 
concerned about competitiveness, fiscal sustainability, the 
growing demands of citizens, and lowering of costs (Rinal-
di et al., 2015) and need to adapt to changes to maintain le-
gitimacy, improve performance, and create value (Daman-
pour et al., 2009). Of course, situations may arise where 
it is not possible to maintain or improve public service 
performance without breaking with established practices 
(Hartley et al., 2013). Tackling these challenges and the 
complex and evolving mix of technical and social factors 
require innovative ideas and unconventional approaches 
(Eisenhardt et al, 2016), since they are perceived by in-
dividuals as new (Rogers, 1995) and represent disconti-
nuity with the past (Osborne & Brown, 2011). In addition 
to improving the performance of public organizations as 
an intangible organizational resource, innovation is in-
creasingly recognized under new public management as 
a means for effectively addressing social challenges such 
as growing citizen expectations, globalization, and demo-
graphic and climate change as well as boosting economic 
growth (Cannaerts et al., 2020). Innovation in the public 
sector can take place in delivery, coordination, regulatory, 
and analytical areas (Lodge & Wegrich, 2014). 

However, public organizations face tensions between 
pressures for innovation (Plimmer et al., 2017) and the 
demand for efficiency and accountability (Hartley et al., 
2013). Instead of increasing their innovation capacity, 
managers of public organizations tend to focus on improv-
ing the ability of public servants to deliver, regulate, and 
coordinate tasks (Lodge & Wegrich, 2014) and streamlin-
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ing internal and external operations to optimize efficiency 
(Nowacki & Monk, 2020). Bureaucracies have tradition-
ally been organized around exploitation of existing re-
sources and capabilities, and are often incompatible with 
explorative activities that produce innovation (Boukamel 
& Emery, 2017). They are characterized by centralized 
decision-making, standardized work processes, and high 
levels of specialization, and their structure stimulates ex-
ploitation, while suppressing innovation (Cannaerts et al., 
2016). Hence, public organizations have always faced 
challenges in improving performance through innovation 
(Osborne & Brown, 2011). However, the public sector is 
urged to innovate and at the same time enhance efficiency 
and lower costs (Pollitt & Bouckaert, 2004) since relying 
on formal organizational routines is not enough to improve 
performance (Brown & Duguid, 1991). Public organiza-
tions must be both efficient and innovative to overcome 
today’s challenges (Cannaerts et al., 2016) and finding the 
right balance between exploitation and exploration is es-
sential to improving organizational performance (March, 
1991).

Individual ambidexterity is a key factor in organiza-
tional performance (Kammerlander et al., 2015) that helps 
organizations overcome the structural inertia caused by the 
focus on exploitation, while preventing excessive explora-
tion that is without results (Levinthal & March, 1993). De-
spite the emphasis of new public management on establish-
ing exploration units in public organizations (Boukamel & 
Emery, 2017;) and despite the initial research on ambidex-
terity in the public sector (Smith & Umans, 2015; Plimmer 
et al., 2017; Gieske et al., 2019), there is little evidence on 
how public organizations can simultaneously balance effi-
ciency and innovation (Smith & Umans, 2015) and little 
insights as to the conditions under which it can emerge in 
the public sector (Umans et al., 2020). While focus on op-
timization can improve the current performance of public 
organizations and allow them to provide existing services 
at a lower cost and with higher efficiency, pressures from 
the external environment require them to engage in explor-
ative activities. 

Although ambidexterity is a useful concept for un-
derstanding the non-financial outcomes of public organ-
izations (Umans et al., 2020), it is difficult to explain its 
effects on performance (Junni et al., 2013). Disagreements 
seem to stem from the context in which it is studied, and 
the relationship between ambidexterity and organizational 
performance needs further investigation, especially in the 
public sector. Therefore, the second hypothesis is devel-
oped as follows:

H2: Organizational ambidexterity has a positive effect 
on organizational performance.

2.3	Mediating role of organizational 
ambidexterity

Psychological capital is an individual’s positive ap-
praisal of circumstances and probability of success based 
on motivated effort and perseverance (Luthans et al., 
2007;). It gives individual the conviction to face challeng-
es and difficulties and to recover from setbacks. Psycho-
logical capital contributes to an individual’s organizational 
performance. However, the way in which psychological 
capacities transform into tangible outcomes such as high 
productivity and better organizational citizenship be-
havior is often mediated by other factors . For example, 
psychological capital helps individuals balance explora-
tion and exploitation (Gibson & Birkinshaw, 2004) and 
enables them to mobilize their affective, cognitive, and 
positive organizational behavioral resources to organiza-
tional citizenship behavior and to achieve organizational 
goals (Pouramini, Fayyazi, & Yahyavi Ghasem Ghesh-
laghi, 2018). From this perspective, psychological capital 
helps improve performance by enhancing ambidexterity, 
and ambidexterity acts as a mediator between contextual 
factors and organizational performance to encourage be-
haviors needed to improve performance (Gibson & Birkin-
shaw, 2004). Employees with high levels of psychological 
capital are more resilient to tensions, conflicts, and stress 
and can make better decisions. Therefore, they will be 
more adaptive to change and make the right optimization 
decisions, which can ultimately lead to high behavioral 
ambidexterity and better performance. 

Patel et al. (2013) showed that ambidexterity mediates 
the relationship between high-performance work systems 
and firm growth, and that firms with such systems achieve 
higher performance through ambidexterity (Patel et al., 
2013). In addition, ambidextrous behavior has been shown 
to mediate the relationship between career adaptability 
and performance and facilitate effective service delivery 
(Affum-Osei et al, 2020). Ambidexterity also mediates the 
relationship between ambidextrous organizational culture 
and innovation outcomes (Wang & Rafiq, 2014), human 
resource flexibility and performance (Úbeda-García et al., 
2017), and management team behavioral integration and 
performance (Lubatkin et al., 2006). Therefore, it can be 
assumed that:

H3: Organizational ambidexterity mediates the rela-
tionship between psychological capital and performance. 

Given this background, the present study follows the 
conceptual model shown in Figure 1 in which the psycho-
logical capital of employees strengthens organizational 
ambidexterity and organizational ambidexterity improves 
the performance of public organizations.
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Figure 1: Conceptual model

3	 Methodology

3.1	Sample and Procedure

The participants of this study are the managers of Man-
agement and Planning Organizations in the 31 provinces 
of Iran, which are responsible for planning and budgeting 
and should continuously evaluate the performance of their 
respective organizations and ensure that budget targets are 
met. These organizations are bureaucracies with central-
ized decision-making. Therefore, due to the similarity of 
tasks and uniformity of structures throughout the country, 
simple random sampling was used to select the partici-
pants in each province. To this end, the middle and top 
managerial of each organization was used for sampling 
(N = 644). Then, the questionnaire was emailed to the 
managers of each organization between March and May 
2021Finally, 373 participants returned the questionnaire, 
of whom 68.4% were male and 31.6% female; 6.2% had a 
doctoral degree, 64.6% had a master’s degree, 27.1% had 
a bachelor’s degree, and 2.1% had an associate degree or 
lower; 58% were in the 40-50 years age group, and none 
of the participants was below 30 years of age. The Kai-
ser-Meyer-Olkin (KMO) index was 0.932 and chi-square 
was 3272.918, which indicate sample size adequacy.

3.2	Measures

3.2.1	Organizational ambidexterity

Ambidexterity is considered a paradox whereby its 
components, i.e. exploration and exploitation, create per-
sistent and conflicting demands on an organization (Ko-
ryak et al., 2018). We used individual ambidexterity to 
measure organizational ambidexterity, because in public 
organizations that are highly centralized and bureaucrat-
ic, it is the ability of managers to behave ambidextrously 
that determines the organization’s approach to exploration 
and exploitation, and it is the managers’ innovative behav-
ior that promotes creative and explorative activities in the 

organization. Therefore, we argue that organizational am-
bidexterity in government agencies is driven by the ambi-
dextrous behavior of managers.

 In the present research, ambidexterity is assessed using 
the questionnaire of Sharma et al. (2020), which consists 
of 10 items, 5 for exploration and 5 for exploitation, rated 
on a 5-point Likert scale. Examples of items in this section 
are “Our organization bases its success on its ability to ex-
plore new methods”, and “Our organization continuously 
improves the reliability of its services.” The items are rated 
from 1 for “Completely Disagree” to 5 for “Completely 
Agree”. The Cronbach’s alpha for the two subscales are 
0.88 and 0.857, respectively.

3.2.2	Psychological capital

Psychological capital is one of the important concept 
in positive psychology that focuses on individual strengths 
and performance improvement in different aspects of life 
(Youssef & Luthans, 2007). In addition to the four main 
components of psychological capital, namely hope, effi-
cacy, resilience, and optimism, many other positive psy-
chological resources such as creativity, gratitude, spiritual-
ity, and courage can be included in the measurement of 
psychological capital (Luthans & Youssef, 2017). These 
eight components are adopted in the present research: 6 
items for efficacy, resilience, optimism, and hope (Luthans 
et al., 2007a) with a Cronbach’s alpha of 0.89, 0.89, 0.89, 
and 0.88, respectively; 12 items for courage (Norton & 
Weiss, 2009) with a Cronbach’s alpha of 0.877; 6 items 
for gratitude (McCullough et al., 2002) with a Cronbach’s 
alpha (0.82); 22 items for spirituality (Delaney, 2005) 
with a Cronbach’s alpha of 0.94; and 4 items for creativity 
(Jaiswal & Dhar, 2015) with a Cronbach’s alpha of 0.93. 
These items are rated on a 5-point Likert scale from 1 for 
“Strongly Disagree” to 5 for “Strongly Agree”. Examples 
of items in this section are: “I feel confident in represent-
ing my work area in meetings with management”; “At the 
present time, I am energetically pursuing my goals”; “I 
can get through difficult times at work because I’ve ex-
perienced difficulty before”; “I always look on the bright 
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side of things regarding my job”; “I am grateful to many 
people”; “I tend to face my fears”; “I believe that all liv-
ing creatures deserve respect”; “I seek new ways to solve 
problems.”

3.2.3	Organizational performance

Organizational performance can be defined as the actu-
al results of an organization as measured against its intend-
ed outputs. In the present research, organizational perfor-
mance is measured using the scale of Gieske et al. (2019) 
with six items. Examples of these items are: “we deliver 
more quality against similar costs and time”; and “stake-
holders are satisfied with the organization”. These items 
are rated on a 5-point Likert scale from 1 for “Strongly 
Disagree” to 5 for “Strongly Agree”. A Cronbach’s alpha 
of 0.856 has been obtained for this scale by Gieske et al. 
(2019). 

4	 Results

4.1	Analysis results

Smart PLS and SPSS 20 were used to analyze the data. 
Before testing the hypotheses, the validity of the instru-
ment was evaluated using convergent validity and discri-
minant validity. In addition, confirmatory factor analysis 
(CFA) was used to evaluate the measurement model.

Several goodness of fit indices such as relative fit in-
dex (RFI), normed fit index (NFI), and comparative fit in-
dex (CFI) that have been suggested for structural equation 
modeling (SEM) (Kline, 2015) were used to evaluate the 
fit of the proposed model. Table 1 shows the measures of 
central tendency and dispersion as well as the correlation 
of the variables.

Table 1: Correlation index between variables

4.2	Discriminant validity of constructs 

First, CFA was performed to test the construct validi-
ty of psychological capital, organizational ambidexterity, 
and organizational performance. To this end, two models 
were selected and compared. First, first-order CFA was 
performed and the results showed the validity of the eight 
components of the psychological capital (efficacy, hope, 
resilience, optimism, gratitude, courage, spirituality, and 
creativity) (NNFI = 0.95, CFI = 0.94 , NFI = 0.94, RM-
SEA = 0.042), the mediator variable organizational ambi-
dexterity (NNFI = 0.94, CFI = 0.90, NFI = 0.91, RMSEA 
= 0.048), and the dependent variable organizational perfor-
mance (NNFI = 0.91, CFI = 0.92, NFI = 0.90, RMSEA = 
0.022), indicating that the model is a good fit. 

In the second path, the structural equation model of 
the research was evaluated using standard errors and all 

factor loadings are greater than 0.05 (NNFI = 0.99, CFI = 
0.99, NFI = 0.98, RMSEA = 0.056), thus confirming the 
overall fit of the model. In addition, divergent validity was 
tested by comparing the average variance extracted (AVE) 
for each construct with the square of correlation coeffi-
cients. AVE for each construct was greater than the square 
of the related correlation coefficients, indicating the di-
vergent validity of the constructs. We also used Harman’s 
single-factor test to check for common method bias, and 
the results showed that all correlation coefficients did not 
exceed 0.90 and that there was no common method bias.  
Table 2 shows the overall reliability of the constructs and 
the factor loadings, and Table 3 shows the results of the 
validity test.
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Table 2: Validity of the constructs and factor loadings of the items

Construct Items Loading

PsyCap

NFI = 0.94

IFI = 0.96

CFI = 0.94

Chi-square = 32.41 

RMSEA= 0.042 

Cronbach’s α = 0.966

Efficacy .815

Hope .809

Resilience .751

Optimism .653

Gratitude .758

Courage .745

Spirituality .836

Creativity .663

Organizational 

Performance

NFI = 0.90

IFI = 0.92

CFI = 0.834

Chi-square = 10.55 

RMSEA = 0.022 

Cronbach’s α = 0.966

My organization has improved performance over the last five years for my work 
field on: 

Efficiency (results remain the same or improve against lower costs) .696

Quality (quality increases against similar costs and time) .736

Effectiveness (we reach our goals more effectively) .795

Collaboration (we reach our goals better by combining them with the goals of 
others)

.694

Legitimacy (stakeholders are satisfied with the organization) .664

Future-proofing (we can face the future with confidence and expected future 
developments are included in policies and plans)

.645

Ambidexterity

NFI = 0.91

IFI = 0.91

CFI = 0.90

Chi-square = 62.66 

RMSEA = 0.048 

Cronbach’s α = 0.891

Exploration .596

Exploitation .579

Table 3: Validity test results

Subscales CR AVE MSV ASV

PsyCap 0.952 0.714 0.276 0.276

Ambidexterity 0.898 0.470 0.469 0.469

Performance 0.836 0.462 0.469 0.336

Table 4: Assessment of the structural model

R2               Q2 F2 VIF

Organizational Performance 0.569 0.439 0.428 1.000
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In the present study, SmartPLS 3.0 is used to examine 
the theoretical framework. Prior research reveal that the 
PLS technique is the best in handling both complex large 
and simple models, and there is no need to meet the nor-
mality criteria (Hair et al. 2016). 

Cross-validated redundancy (Q2) as a measure of pre-
dictive relevance was used in this study to measure the 
effects of latent variables. All values must be greater than 
0, and Table 4 shows that the present study satisfies this 
criterion. 

VIF values are also considered as the reciprocal of tol-
erance. The resultsshow that all VIF values are less than 
3.30 (Table 4). Therefore, the data set is not subject to  
common method bias.

In this study, the value of the coefficient of determina-
tion (R2 = 0.569) indicates that psychological capital and 
organizational ambidexterity together explain 46.9% of 
the variance in organizational performance (Table 4).

4.3	Hypothesis testing

Table 5 provides the results of testing the hypotheses. 
Regarding the first hypothesis, the results indicate the pos-
itive effect of psychological capital on organizational am-
bidexterity (F = 141.336, p = 0.000), and  R indicates that 
this effect is significant (R = 0.525).

According to the results in Table 4, the second hypoth-
esis for the positive effect of organizational ambidexterity 
on organizational performance is confirmed (F = 327.963, 
p = 0.000) at the 99% confidence interval (CI).. The results 
also indicate the significant effect of the components of or-
ganizational ambidexterity (exploration and exploitation) 
on organizational performance (R coefficient of 0.659 and 
0.628, respectively). The relationship between exploration 
and organizational performance (B = 0.757) was stronger 
than the relationship between exploitation and organiza-
tional performance (B = 0.743). Table 4 also shows the 
effects of the mediator variable.

Table 5: Structural model results

Variable B SE t P

PsyCap on Performance .55 .006 9.717 0.000

Ambidexterity on Performance .425 0.23 18.110 0.000

Exploitation on Performance .743 .048 15.535 0.000

Exploration on Performance .757 .045 16.891 0.000

Variable Value SE Z P

Indirect effect and significance using normal distribution
0.333 0.044 7.534 0.000

Sobel

Variable M SE LL95%CI UL95%CI

Bootstrap results for indirect effect
0.537 0.054 0.425 0.640

Effect

Note: N = 373 Bootstrap sample size = 1000, LL = lower limit, UL = upper limit, CI= confidence interval

Testing the significance of indirect paths using bootstrapping and the Sobel test showed that organizational ambidexterity sig-nificantly 
mediates the relationship between psychological capital and organizational performance at the 95% CI (LL = 0.425; UL = 0.640).

5	 Discussion

Previous studies on organizational ambidexterity have 
mainly focused on the development of this ability at the 
organizational and team levels (Gibson & Birkinshaw, 
2004), but this study sought to gain a deeper understand-
ing of the psychological factors that underlie different 
behaviors among individuals and explore the relationship 
between the contexts of individual behaviors and develop-
ment of ambidexterity in the organization. 

The results showed that psychological capital can have 
a direct impact on the components of organizational ambi-

dexterity, which is consistent with Kauppila and Tempe-
laar (2016). For example, Kauppila and Tempelaar (2016) 
highlight the significant role of psychological capital, 
including efficacy, in the capacity of individuals for am-
bidextrous behavior, because high levels of efficacy pro-
motes ambitious goal-setting and greater effort, thus help-
ing individuals to manage the challenges associated with 
paradoxical orientations and conflicting work demands. 
This is consistent with the findings of Katou (2021), with 
one difference in that Katou shows that ambidexterity is 
affected by human capital, which is itself positively in-
fluenced by the dynamically changing environment. This 
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indicates the importance of acquiring and strengthening 
capabilities for public sector organizations that enable in-
dividuals and managers to be effective in both optimization 
and innovation and gain mastery in dealing with existing 
tensions (Gieske et al., 2019) and the changing environ-
ment to achieve higher productivity. As another compo-
nent of psychological capital, hope encourages individuals 
to persevere toward goals and redirect paths toward them 
if necessary. Especially in public organizations, past suc-
cesses can give individuals greater hope in innovative ide-
as and help them better enforce laws in the face of change.

As expected, ambidexterity was associated with higher 
levels of perceived performance. This is consistent with 
previous studies that have found the positive effect of am-
bidexterity on performance (e.g., Junni et al., 2013; Plim-
mer et al., 2017; Gieske et al., 2019). Of course the level 
of analysis and the method of measurement can affect the 
relationship between ambidexterity and organizational 
performance (Junni et al., 2013). In public organizations, 
performance is defined as achieving public goals effective-
ly and efficiently, while preserving present and future qual-
ity of public services and maintaining legitimacy among 
stakeholders (Verbeeten, 2008). Even when faced with 
diminishing financial resources, public organizations are 
expected to continuously improve the quality of their ser-
vices to maintain public confidence (Pablo et al., 2007). 
Organizations that are able to simultaneously pursue ex-
ploration and exploitation are more likely to outperform 
those that focus on one of these at the expense of the oth-
er (Tushman & O’Reilly, 2013), because it will inevita-
bly create problems and tensions (Gibson & Birkinshaw, 
2004) that undermine long-term performance (Floyd & 
Lane, 2000). Lack of functionality of rules promotes ambi-
dextrous behavior, while compliance burden is negatively 
associated with ambidexterity (Sharma et al., 2020). While 
public organizations are required to comply with the rules 
regardless of their burden, lack of functionality can stimu-
late search for new paths and more innovative approaches.   

The results of the present research also showed the sig-
nificant positive relationship between the components of 
ambidexterity and performance. This finding is consistent 
with the results of Gieske et al. (2020), and Gieske et al. 
(2019). To fulfill employee obligations, organizations not 
only must increase their performance in providing exist-
ing services, but also need to innovate (Nowacki & Monk, 
2020). Acquiring and strengthening capabilities enable 
public organizations to both optimize and innovate and 
deal with existing tensions more proficiently (Gieske et 
al., 2019). Organizations with limited resources are more 
in need of balancing explorative and exploitative activities 
(Cao et al., 2009; Junni et al., 2013), which is essential to 
improving organizational performance (Damanpour et al., 
2009). This is extremely challenging in public organiza-
tions that are accountable for government budgets, which 
could encourage them to focus more on exploitation than 

innovation to meet budget targets and avoid conflicts or 
even penalties. However, in a dynamic environment, ex-
cessive exploitation reduces the ability of the organization 
to effectively adapt to changes (Wang & Li, 2008) and in 
general. As such, performance improvement in the pub-
lic sector largely depends on innovation, which does not 
receive enough attention in the current organizational dis-
course (Choi & Chandler, 2015; Osborne & Brown, 2011; 
Gieske et al., 2019) and requires a shift from overexploita-
tion to ambidexterity.

According to the present findings, exploration has a 
stronger effect on performance than exploitation, which 
is inconsistent with the results of a number of studies. 
Damanpour et al. (2009) found that optimization has a 
stronger effect on performance than innovation, implying 
that public organizations often try to enhance their perfor-
mance through continuous improvement of policies, pro-
cesses, techniques, and services rather than by engaging 
in innovation due to its perceived risks and higher trans-
action costs (Damanpour et al., 2009; Gieske et al., 2019). 
The literature disproportionately emphasizes innovation, 
while the potential cost or risks are underestimated (Choi 
& Chandler, 2015). Public organizations usually have a 
high degree of formalization, which is positively associ-
ated with exploitative innovation, but not with explorative 
innovation (Jansen et al., 2006). These organizations have 
well-designed procedures, facilitate performance, encour-
age employee commitment, and reduce role conflict and 
ambiguity. Research on the effect of formalization on am-
bidexterity has yielded mixed results (Junni et al., 2015). 
Nonetheless, the positive effect of innovation is notewor-
thy and directly affects organizational performance as an 
organizational capability (Lin & Chen, 2007).

The results of this study also showed that organiza-
tional ambidexterity not only affects organizational perfor-
mance directly, but also mediate the relationship between 
psychological capital and organizational performance. 
Psychological capital is a key construct in positive psy-
chology, which focuses on the positive aspects of individ-
uals instead of what is wrong or dysfunctional with them 
(Luthans et al., 2006) and improves performance and ad-
aptability relying on the strengths of individuals and the 
organization (Luthans et al., 2007b; Pouramini, Fayyazi, & 
Yahyavi Ghasem Gheshlaghi, 2018). Psychological capital 
affects individual productivity and can be a source of com-
petitive advantage for organizations (Pouramini, Fayyazi, 
& Yahyavi Ghasem Gheshlaghi, 2018). It is also positively 
associated with organizational performance (Luthans & 
Youssef, 2017), and this effect is reinforced by ambidex-
terity. Our findings in this regard are consistent with the 
results of Patel et al. (2013), Úbeda-García et al. (2017), 
and Affum-Osei et al. (2020), which have confirmed the 
mediation effect of ambidexterity on various organiza-
tional outcomes. As Gibson and Birkinshaw (2004) have 
argued, ambidexterity is not only an organizational capa-
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bility, but also a meta-capability that mediates the rela-
tionship between various contextual features and organi-
zational performance. Ambidexterity is a vital mechanism 
(Affum-Osei et al. 2020) that creates new capacities for 
the organization while strengthening other beneficial rela-
tionships. The overall model of the effect of psychological 
capital and ambidexterity on organizational performance 
is consistent with Katou (2021), who found that human 
capital management practices constitute an antecedent of 
organizational ambidexterity and organizational perfor-
mance constitutes a consequence.

Finally, psychological capital not only plays a crucial 
role in the implementation of ambidexterity, but is also 
among the factors that directly and indirectly contribute to 
organizational success. Public organizations need to iden-
tify and evaluate different dimensions of psychological 
capital in their managers and employees, and promote and 
develop them by implementing short and long-term pro-
grams. These organizations should also take full advantage 
of psychological capital in their attempt to achieve organ-
izational ambidexterity, and consider it when appointing 
individuals to management positions, which will be crucial 
to improving organizational performance.

This study has a number of limitations. Firstly, it uses 
cross-sectional data, which means that it fails to capture 
the dynamic interplay between psychological capabilities 
and ambidexteity. 

Secondly, our findings are limited by the nature of the 
sample, which consists of government organizationas with 
higly centeralized decision-making processes. The results 
may be different in future studies on other industries, e.g., 
in private companies with decentralized management sys-
tems.

Thirdly, the data on the independent variable (psycho-
logical capital), the dependent variable (organizational 
performance), and the mediating variable (organizational 
ambidexterity) was collected using the same survey. Al-
though this is a common practise in the field, we tested 
for common method bias and  found no cause for concern 
(Podsakoff et al., 2003).

Future researhers are encouraged to replicate the pro-
posed model in other organizations that compete with oth-
ers to survive.
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Psihološki kapital in organizacijska uspešnost: posredniška vloga organizacijske ambideksternosti

Ozadje: Današnje dinamično okolje vse bolj pritiska na javne organizacije, da so hkrati fleksibilne in učinkovite. 
Namen te študije je bil preučiti posredniško vlogo organizacijske ambideksternosti v razmerju med psihološkim kapi-
talom in uspešnostjo javnih organizacij, ki imajo birokratske omejitve pri svojem delovanju in niso tako konkurenčne 
kot zasebni sektor.
Metodologija: Razvit je bil vprašalnik, ki je bil razdeljen med zaposlene v organizacijah za upravljan-je in načrto-
vanje v 31 provincah v Iranu. Vrnjenih je bilo skupaj 373 vprašalnikov. Podatki so bili analizirani z uporabo CFA za 
validacijo ukrepov, nato pa smo testirali posredovalne učinki organi-zacijske ambideksternosti.
Rezultati: Rezultati so pokazali pomembno razmerje med psihološkim kapitalom in organizacijsko uspešnostjo 
(B=0,55) ter pozitiven mediacijski učinek organizacijske ambideksternosti na to razmerje (0,333).
Zaključek: Ugotovitve lahko pomagajo menedžerjem javnih organizacij izboljšati njihovo organi-zacijsko uspešnost 
s krepitvijo psihološkega kapitala in dvosmernosti.

Ključne besede: Organizacijska ambideksternost, Psihološki kapital, Organizacijska uspešnost, Javne organizacije


